
2024 Presidential Election 

Comparing Previous Term Records 

 Republican Administration Democratic Administration 
Fomented a violent insurrection. Has 
been impeached twice, indicted for 88 
crimes by U.S. and state prosecutors. So 
far found guilty of 34 felony crimes and 
found liable for rape and defamation of 
character resulting over $500 million in 
damages. 

Department of Justice convicted 1000+ 
insurrectionists and rioters, so far. 

Hindered attempts by health experts to 
protect us against Covid, many say at the 
cost of more than 100,000 American 
lives.  See a timeline / DEADline HERE. 

Made sure that all Americans who 
wanted were vaccinated. 

Weakened, corrupted and tried to 
weaponize democratic institutions. 

Restored integrity and efficacy in 
government. 

Destroyed America’s reputation and 
trust among our allies and has attacked 
NATO. 

Restored our international relationships 
and trust. 

Enacted a $2 trillion massive tax cut 
for the rich. 

Passed historic bottom up, middle out 
legislation and executive orders that 
benefit everyone, especially those who 
need help the most.  

Flouted norms and rule of law.  See 
above. 

Respected, obeyed and enforced laws. 

Separated thousands of children from 
their parents indefinitely.  Killed bipartisan 
immigration agreement after by 
intimidating GOP Congress. 

Reunited families.  Worked with Senate 
to pass the bi-partisan bipartisan 
immigration bill 

Economy Performance 

  -2,826,020  JOB CREATION    +10,001,000 JOB CREATION  

  +25.7%  JOB OPENINGS    +39% JOB OPENINGS 

  -154,000  MANUFACTURING    +696,000 MANUFACTURING 

  6.3% - UNEMPLOYMENT RATE     3.5% UNEMPLOYMENT RATE 

  +50% FED. DEBT HELD BY PUBLIC   12.2% FED. DEBT HELD BY PUBLIC 

  +3M PEOPLE W/O HEALTH INS.   -1.6M PEOPLE W/O HEALTH INS. 

 
Data: FactCheck.org Trump and Biden (Biden’s Data is 2 years from 2021-2022 

https://edition.cnn.com/interactive/2020/10/politics/covid-disappearing-trump-comment-tracker/
http://factcheck.org/

